BID TABULATION: REVISED

I Montgomery College

Procurement Office
900 Hungerford Drive Suite 110
Rockville, MD 20850

www.montgomerycollege.edu/departments/procure

b d

Printing and Mailing Services:

BID #408-005 Insights Magazine
Bid Opening Date/Time Purchasing Agent Recorded By
October 26, 2007 Sena Wiles Louise Ng

BIDDER FALL ISSUE SPRING ISSUE ADDITIONAL AAs
COPIES

Magazine Printing Envelope Printing & | Addressing & TOTAL FALL Magazine Envelope Addressing & TOTAL SPRING || 1,000 Increments Hourly
Insertion Mailing Printing Printing & Mailing Rate

Insertion

Westland Printers $83,596.00 $31,925.00 $7,124.00 | $2,749.00 $41,798.00 | $31,925.00 $7,124.00 $2,749.00 $41,798.00 $361.00 | $110.00
Burtonsville, MD

S&S Graphics $84,210.00 $34,415.00 $3,615.00 | $3,510.00 $41,540.00 | $35,235.00 $3,925.00 $3,510.00 $42,670.00 $407.00 $75.00
Laurel, MD

Mount Royal $92,540.00 $35,931.00 $5,670.00 | $4,669.00 $46,270.00 | $35,931.00 $5,670.00 $4,669.00 | $46,270.00 $310.00 $60.00
Printing Co.
Baltimore, MD

McDonald & Eudy $87,280.00 $31,900.00 $8,800.00 | $2,940.00 $43,640.00 | $31,900.00 $8,800.00 $2,940.00 $43,640.00 $389.09 $75.00
Printers, Inc.
Temple Hills, MD
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BIDDER

TOTAL

ANNUAL

FALL ISSUE

SPRING ISSUE

ADDITIONAL

COPIES

PRICE
Magazine Printing Envelope Printing & | Addressing & TOTAL FALL Magazine Envelope Addressing & TOTAL SPRING || 1,000 Increments Hourly
Insertion Mailing Printing Printing & Mailing Rate
Insertion
Graphic Visions $97,806.00 $35,530.00 $6,600.00 | $6,076.00 $48,206.00 | $36,300.00 $6,930.00 $6,370.00 | $49,600.00 $312.00 $95.00
Gaithersburg, MD
Goetz Printing $103,040.00 $35,188.00 $13,938.00 | $2,394.00 | $51,520.00 | $35,188.00 | $13,938.00 $2,394.00 | $51,520.00 $82.00 $64.00
Company
Springfield, VA
Gray Graphics $104,260.90 $44,836.00 $4,642.55 | $2,651.90 $52,130.45 | $44,836.00 $4,642.55 $2,651.90 | $52,130.45 $379.00 $80.00
Capitol Heights,
MD
Cenveo $108,337.00 $39,204.00 $10,384.00 | $3,145.00 $52,733.00 | $42,075.00 | $10,384.00 $3,145.00 | $55,604.00 $409.17 $80.00
Baltimore, MD
Balmar NO BID
Gaithersburg, MD
Key Printing & NO BID
Duplicating Inc.
Laurel, MD
Print Art, Inc. NO BID
Egg Harbor
Township, NJ
Todd Allan Printers NO BID
Beltsville, MD
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