BID TABULATION

I Montgomery College

& Procurement Office

900 Hungerford Drive Suite 110
Rockville, MD 20850

www.montgomerycollege.edu/departments/procure

BID #409-021 Printing, Online, and Delivery

Services for College Stationery
and Business Cards

Bid Opening Date/Time Purchasing Agent Recorded By
May 15, 2009 at 3:00 p.m. Sena Wiles Michelle White
BIDDER ITEMS GRAND TOTAL PRICE
BCs SLH S2LH | #10R #10W | 9.5x12.5B | 9.5x12.5W | #9BRE

New Cumberland, PA
Balmar Inc. $16.10 | $41.11 | $17.82 | $29.60 | $39.17 $69.30 $64.50 | $28.80 $306.40
Gaithersburg, MD
Prospect Park, NJ
Rockville, MD
Rockville Printing & Graphics $19.95 | $39.95 | $19.95 | $49.95 | $51.95 $114.95 $84.95 | $55.95 $437.60
Rockville, MD
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BIDDER ITEMS GRAND TOTAL PRICE
BCs SLH S2LH | #10R #10W | 9.5x12.5B | 9.5x12.5W | #9BRE

Rockville, MD
Pronto Press $41.00 | $64.00 | $31.38 | $96.00 | $102.00 |  $214.00 $162.00 | $96.00 $806.38
Bethesda, MD
Vineland, NJ
Landover, MD
Westland Printers $22.00 $81.00 | $30.50 $94.00 $99.00 $310.00 $295.00 $94.00 $1’02550
Laurel, MD
HBP Inc. $114.00 | $126.00 | $14.00 | $132.00 | $136.00 $312.00 $278.00 | $133.00 $1’24500
Hagerstown, MD

Cavanaugh Press

Baltimore, MD No Bid
Cheerio Printing .
Rockville, MD No Bid
EPS Printing Solutions .
Gaithersburg, MD No Bid
Kirby Lithographic Company, Inc. No Bid
Arlington, VA

Rudolph’s Office & Computer Supply No Bid

Baltimore, MD
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