
 
 
 
NOTE:  This Bid Tabulation is only a statement of pricing and does not reflect bid evaluation or 
award. 
Montgomery College Bid Tabulation #508-001   

BID TABULATION 

 
 

 
 

Montgomery College 
Procurement Office 

900 Hungerford Drive Suite 110 
Rockville, MD 20850 

www.montgomerycollege.edu/departments/procure 

 

BID #508-001 
Arts Institute Web Application 

Development 
 

 
Bid Opening Date and Time Purchasing Agent Recorded By 

August 16, 2007 3:00 PM Patrick Johnson Louise Ng 
 

Bidder Development & 
Implementation 
of Arts Institute 

Website 

Hosting of 
newly created 

web-site 
(Per Month) 

Maintenance of 
newly created 

web-site  
(Per Month) 

Grand Total Addendum 
Returned 

Jean Peterson Design $32,500.00 $45.79 $325.00 $32,870.79 √ 

IO Solutions Inc. $38,500.00 $41.67 $0.00 $38,541.67 √ 

RAM $45,000.00 $225.00 $225.00 $45,450.00 √ 

Mavenspire Inc. $58,000.00 $20.00 $20.00 $58,040.00 √ 

Commercial Media $112,595.00 $295.00 T.B.D. $112,890.00 √ 

Blackwell Consulting 
Services 

$199,000.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $201,000.00 √ 

H.S. Biswas $258,000.00 $150.00 $150.00 $258,300.00 √ 

Fastspot     X 

Blue Atlas Interactive NO BID 

E-Paga, Inc. NO BID 

SLICE NO BID 

Catalpha NO BID 

Design to Delivery Inc. NO BID 




