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Montgomery College Bid Tabulation #509-022   

BID TABULATION 

 
 

 
 

Montgomery College 
Procurement Office 

900 Hungerford Drive Suite 110 
Rockville, MD 20850 

www.montgomerycollege.edu/departments/procure 

 

BID #509-022 Laerdal Nursing Manikins 
 

 
Bid Opening Date and Time Purchasing Agent Recorded By 
October 30, 2008 at 3:00 PM Patrick Johnson Louise Ng 

 
BIDDER Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Grand Total 

      

Amerisochi Inc. $7,800.00 $3,680.00 $2,050.00 $0.00 $13,530.00 

Armstrong Medical $8,314.00 $3,922.00 $3,002.00 $0.00 $15,238.00 

Laerdal $10,078.00 $4,755.00 $2,689.00 $200.22 $17,722.22 

Boundtree Medical NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 


