
LINE ITEM # VSA, Inc.
Ascent 
Media 

Lerro Corp.
Technical 

Video 
Systems

Professional 
Products

Chyron 
Corp.

Videotape 
Products 

Inc.

Communica-
tions 

Engineering

001 NO BID NO BID $78,700.00 NO BID $79,695.83 $96,700.00 NO BID $78,600.10

002 NO BID NO BID $61,100.00 $35,000.00 $28,434.68 NO BID NO BID $28,512.89

003 NO BID NO BID $115,375.00 $114,250.00 $102,922.36 NO BID NO BID $99,189.01

004 NO BID NO BID $52,738.00 $51,400.00 $53,772.54 NO BID NO BID $51,351.44

005 NO BID NO BID $4,700.00 $4,400.00 $4,285.71 NO BID $3,995.00 $4,092.75

006 NO BID NO BID $18,335.00 $19,150.00 $19,413.27 NO BID NO BID $19,924.80

007 NO BID NO BID $12,780.00 $12,680.00 $12,925.64 NO BID $11,628.00 $12,820.00

008 NO BID NO BID discountinued discountinued discountinued discountinued discountinued discountinued

009 NO BID NO BID $935.00 $930.00 $957.36 NO BID NO BID $925.55

010 NO BID NO BID $12,125.00 $10,900.00 $10,699.72 NO BID $10,799.00 $10,519.00

011 NO BID NO BID $225.00 $0.00 $193.91 NO BID $194.00 $0.00

012 NO BID NO BID $6,900.00 $7,100.00 $6,741.00 NO BID $6,285.00 $6,709.99

013 NO BID NO BID $1,575.00 $1,600.00 $1,496.00 NO BID $1,403.00 $1,488.58

014 NO BID NO BID $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,144.00 NO BID $1,073.00 $1,138.00

015 NO BID NO BID $750.00 $2,300.00 $750.00 $47.00 $0.00 $600.00

Bid Opening Date/Time
September 10, 2009 3:00 PM

Purchasing Agent
Patrick Johnson

NOTE: This Bid Tabulation is only a statement of pricing and does not reflect bid evaluation or award.
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