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BID TABULATION

Bid Title: Pharmaceutical Refrigerator/Freezer, Bid No. 510-009  OPEN DATE: 9/10/09
Andwin Scientific
ITEM Manufacturer Part Number/Description QTY Unit Price [Total
2.2.1 SANYO #MPR-414F 3| $4,949.11 $14,847.33
2.2.2 DOCK DELIVERY 1 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $14,847.33
Webster & Assoc.
ITEM Manufacturer Part Number/Description QTy Unit Price |Total
2.2.1 SANYO H#MPR-414F 3] $5,800.00 $17,400.00
2.2.2 DOCK DELIVERY 1 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $17,400.00
Business Services
ITEM Manufacturer Part Number/Description QTY Unit Price |Total
2.2.1 SANYO #MPR-414F 3] S$5,179.99 $15,539.97
2.2.2 DOCK DELIVERY 1 50.00 50.00
TOTAL $15,539.97
Johnson Scientific
ITEM Manufacturer Part Number/Description QTY Unit Price |Total
2.2.1 SANYO #MPR-414F 3] $3,900.00 $11,700.00
2.2.2 DOCK DELIVERY 1 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $11,700.00
VWR
ITEM Manufacturer Part Number/Description QTy Unit Price |Total
2.2.1 SANYO #MPR-414F 3| $4,012.00 $12,036.00
2.2.2 DOCK DELIVERY 1 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $12,036.00
GTS Scientific.
ITEM Manufacturer Part Number/Description QTY Unit Price |Total
2.2.1 SANYO #MPR-414F 3| $3,317.00 $9,951.00
2.2.2 DOCK DELIVERY 3 $175.00 $525.00
TOTAL $10,476.00
Amerisochi
ITEM Manufacturer Part Number/Description QTy Unit Price |Total
2.2.1 SANYO #MPR-414F 3] $3,999.00 $11,997.00
2.2.2 DOCK DELIVERY 3 $100.00 $300.00
TOTAL $12,297.00
Geneva Scientific
ITEM Manufacturer Part Number/Description Qry Unit Price [Total
2.2.1 NO BID NO BID 3 $0.00 $0.00
2.2.2 NO BID NO BID 1 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $0.00
Fox Scientific
ITEM Manufacturer Part Number/Description QTY Unit Price [Total
2.2.1 NO BID NO BID 3 $0.00 $0.00
2.2.2 NO BID NO BID 1 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL $0.00




