
 

To: Montgomery College Community  

From: Dr. J ermaine F. Williams , Pres ident  

Subject: Tragedy of the Texas  Massacre   

Date: May 25, 2022  

Yes terday’s  horrific s hooting in the Uvalde County elementary s chool has  left families  grieving and 
communities  shaken. The trauma of another mass  s hooting at a  s chool—this  one predominated by 
Hispanic s tudents —creates  anxiety and s tres s  even among those not in clos e proximity to the location. 
Schools  are s upposed to be s anctuaries  for our s tudents  and laboratories  for personal growth and 
development. It is  heartbreaking when any one of them is  the target of s ens eles s  violence. 
Montgomery College s tudents  can reach out for as s is tance with this  or other couns eling matters , and 
faculty and s taff in need can seek help, as  well. There are a ls o s everal upcoming mental health 
awarenes s  s es s ions  for faculty and s taff that may be us eful in proces s ing the impacts  of s uch 
tragedies . 
  
This  la tes t event—also in the wake of violence in Buffalo, New York, and Orange County, California , 
which targeted people of color—leaves  me pers onally angered and determined. If our s ociety claims  to 
reject violence agains t anyone in our communities , we mus t as k ours elves  how we can do better. We 
mus t as k ourselves  what mus t be done differently. The hate fueling thes e horrific tragedies  s hould 
have no place in our s ociety. Montgomery College has  long been a bas tion of divers ity and inclus ion. It 
has  demons trated a  powerful bent towards  social jus tice. A robus t civil society marries  these two 
elements  so that a ll of our members  are engaged and s upported. I encourage all members  of our 
community to look for ways  to engage in dialogue and critical thinking about violence, racism, and 
exclus ion. The Office of Equity and Inclus ion will hos t a Let’s  Talk event on racism and violence on 
J une 7. I urge faculty and s taff to cons ider how their expertis e may add to thes e dis cus s ions , and I 
invite s tudents  to collaborate with one another in advancing new s trategies  and s olutions  to the 
pres s ing problem of violence.  
  
Ins titutions  of higher education, community colleges  in particular, mus t play an active role in crafting 
s olutions  that protect our communities .  

 

https://www.montgomerycollege.edu/counseling-and-advising/personal-counseling.html
https://info.montgomerycollege.edu/offices/human-resources/faculty-staff-assistance-program.html
https://info.montgomerycollege.edu/offices/human-resources/faculty-staff-assistance-program.html
https://info.montgomerycollege.edu/offices/human-resources/faculty-staff-assistance-program.html
https://www.montgomerycollege.edu/about-mc/equity-and-inclusion/index.html

